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GROUP 1 [SDR-26 PVC PIPE (14' JOINTYS) UNIT
3,500 feet PRICE 1.11 1.33 1.44 1.34
1. 4" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14780) TOTAL 3,885.00 4,655.00 5,040.00 4,690.00
UNIT
15,000 feet PRICE 2.38 2.86 3.10 2.79
2. 6" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14787) TOTAL 35,700.00 42,900.00 46,500.00 41,850.00
UNIT
12,000 feet PRICE 4.29 5.15 5.59 5.03
3. 8" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14791) TOTAL 51,480.00 61,800.00 67,080.00 60,360.00
UNIT
1,000 feet PRICE 6.73 8.10 8.75 7.87
4. 10" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14757) TOTAL 6,730.00 8,100.00 8,750.00 7,870.00
UNIT
1,400 feet PRICE 9.59 10.52 12.48 11.23
5. 12" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14764) TOTAL 13,426.00 14,728.00 17,472.00 15,722.00
UNIT
300 feet PRICE 21.79 25.82 31.10 24.25
6. 18" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14800) TOTAL 6,537.00 7,746.00 9,330.00 7,275.00
UNIT
300 feet PRICE 32.66 36.10 46.21 33.25
7. 21" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14801) TOTAL 9,798.00 10,830.00 13,863.00 9,975.00
UNIT
300 feet PRICE 41.60 45.85 54.83 42.85
8. 24" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14802) TOTAL 12,480.00 13,755.00 16,449.00 12,855.00
TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 140,036.00 164,514.00 184,484.00 160,597.00
ADDITIONAL SIZE & ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE
JM/Pipe Life/ Diamond
Manufacturer MFR. Jim Eagle No American/Diamond Plastic Corp.
PRICE Diamond
Price Sheet or Catalog SHEET Price Block Book Block Schedule
DATE
Date of Schedule OF SCH. May 1, 2015 N/A
PERCENT Block 138
Percent Discount DISCOUNT Block 115 Sizes 4"-12"
GROUP 2 |SDR-26 PVC PIPE (20" JOINTS) UNIT
500 feet PRICE 111 1.33 1.54 NO BID
1. 4" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14784) TOTAL 555.00 665.00 770.00
UNIT
500 feet PRICE 2.38 2.86 3.33 NO BID
2. 6" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14789) TOTAL 1,190.00 1,430.00 1,665.00
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UNIT
500 feet PRICE 4.29 5.15 5.65 NO BID
3. 8" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14793) TOTAL 2,145.00 2,575.00 2,825.00
UNIT
300 feet PRICE 6.73 8.10 8.76 NO BID
4, 10" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14759) TOTAL 2,019.00 2,430.00 2,628.00
UNIT
1,000 feet PRICE 9.59 10.52 12.34 NO BID
5. 12" SDR-26, (SAWS No. 14766) TOTAL 9,590.00 10,520.00 12,340.00
*
TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 15,499.00 17,620.00 20,228.00 NO BID
ADDITIONAL SIZE & ITEMS NOT LISTED ABOVE
JM/Pipe Life/ Diamond
Manufacturer MFR. Jim Eagle No American/Diamond Plastic Corp.
PRICE
Price Sheet or Catalog SHEET Block Book N/A
DATE
Date of Schedule OF SCH. May 1, 2015 N/A
PERCENT
Percent Discount DISCOUNT Block 115 N/A
EXTENSION 1 155,535.00
Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATION E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Act Pipe and Supply HD Supply Waterworks Demandstar
Cohen Pipe Hydropro Solution SAWS Website

Core and Main

Corix Water Products
Ferguson

Fortiline Waterworks
Gajeske

KLP Commercial
Milford Online
Morrison Supply
MS Techline Pipe




